ORDINANCE NO. 21-01

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF FORT MYERS BEACH, FLORIDA
AMENDING CHAPTER 6 MAINTENANCE CODES, BUILDING CODES,
AND COASTAL REGULATIONS OF THE LAND DEVELOPMENT
CODE; AMENDING CHAPTER 34-1180 CREATING GARAGE DESIGN
AND LOCATION STANDARDS; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY;
CODIFICATION; SCRIVENER’S ERRORS; CONFLICTS OF LAW AND
PROVIDING AND AN EFFECTIVE DATE

WHEREAS, Florida Statutes provide that municipalities shall have the governmental,
corporate, and proprietary powers to enable them to conduct municipal government, perform
municipal functions, and render municipal service, and exercise any power for municipal purpose,
except when expressly prohibited by law; and

WHEREAS, Article X of the Town Charter of the Town of Fort Myers Beach empowers
the Town to adopt, amend, or repeal such ordinances and resolutions as may be required for the
proper governing of the Town; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council desires to update the Fort Myers Beach Land Development
Code to clarify, improve, and create consistency among sections regarding maintenance codes,
building codes, and coastal regulations; as well as to regulate aesthetics of garage openings; and

WHEREAS, on January 12, 2021 the Local Planning Agency, after giving consideration
to the staff recommendation, public testimony, and consistency with the Comprehensive Plan,
recommended approval of the proposed amendments; and

WHEREAS, on March 1, 2021 the Town Council held a first reading of the proposed
Ordinance, after giving consideration to the staff recommendation, public testimony, and
consistency with Comprehensive Plan, set a second and final reading of the Ordinance; and

WHEREAS, on March 15, 2021 the Town Council held a second reading of the proposed
Ordinance and gave consideration of the staff recommendation, public testimony, and consistency
with the Comprehensive Plan and adopted the Ordinance on final reading.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE TOWN OF FORT
MYERS BEACH AS FOLLOWS:!

Section 1. The above recitals are true and correct, and incorporated herein by this
reference and are hereby adopted as the legislative and administrative findings of the Town
Council.

! Additions to existing text are shown by underline, changes to existing text on second

reading are shown by double underline, and deletions are shown as strikethrough.



Section 2. Chapter 6 and 34 of the Fort Myers Beach Land Development Code is
amended as shown in “Exhibit A”

Section 3. The Town Council intends that the provisions of this ordinance be made a
part of the Fort Myers beach Code of Ordinances, and that sections herein may be renumbered or
re-lettered and the words or phrases herein may be changed to accomplish codification; regardless,
typographical errors that do not affect intent may be corrected with notice to and authorization of
the Town Manager without further process.

Section 4. Whenever the requirements or provisions of this Ordinance are in conflict
with the requirements or provisions of any other lawfully adopted ordinance or statute, the most
restrictive shall apply.

Section S. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is for
any reason, declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be unconstitutional or invalid, such
decision will not affect the validity of the ordinance as a whole, or any part thereof, other than the
part so declared.

Section 6. This Ordinance shall become effective 30 days from adoption by the Town
Council.

The forgoing Ordinance was adopted by the Town Council upon a motion by Council
Member Allers and seconded by Council Member Veach, and upon being put on a roll call vote,
the results was as follows:

Raymond P. Murphy, Mayor Aye
Rexann Hosafros, Vice Mayor Aye
Dan Allers, Council Member Aye

Jim Atterholt, Council Member Aye
Bill Veach, Council Member Aye



ADOPTED this 15" day of March, 2021 by the Town Council of the Town of Fort Myers Beach,
Florida

TOWN OF FORT MYERS BEACH

ATTEST:

Ly LA

Amy Ba , Town Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGAL SUFFICIENCY FOR THE USE AND
RELIANCE|\OF THE TOWN OF FORT MYERS BEACH ONLY:

John R-¥Teéri \ TowWey

nce was filed in the Office of the Town Clerk on this ﬁ?day of March, 2021




EXHIBIT “A”

Chapter 6 - MAINTENANCE CODES, BUILDING CODES AND COASTAL REGULATIONS
ARTICLE I. - PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES

DIVISION 1. - INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

Sec. 6-1. - Adoption of International Property Maintenance Code.

Except as amended or modified in the sections below, the 2009 2018 Edition of the International
Property Maintenance Code, published by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted as the Town
of Fort Myers Beach Property Maintenance Code and shall be the governing law with respect to all
structures and premises in the Town of Fort Myers Beach. A complete copy of this code shall be
maintained on file in the office of the town clerk.

Sec. 6-2. - Amendments.

The 2009 2018 Edition of the International Property Maintenance Code is hereby amended as

follows:

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

b))

Wherever the term "code official” appears in the International Property Maintenance Code, that
term shall be interpreted to mean the Director of the Department or Community Development or
his or her designee. Wherever the term "department” appears in this code, it shall be interpreted
to mean the Department of Community Development. Wherever the terms “International
Building Code" or "International Existing Building Code" appear in this code, the term "Florida
Building Code" shall be substituted for such terms.

Section 101.1 Title, is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Interrational Property Maintenance Code of the Town
of Fort Myers Beach, Florida, hereinafter referred to as "this code."”

Section 102.3 Application of other codes, is amended to read as follows:

Repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy shall be done in
accordance with the procedures and provisions of the Florida Building Code, as amended.

Section 102.6 Historic Buildings, is amended to read as follows:

The provisions of this code shall not be mandatory for existing buildings or structures formally or
officially designated as historic buildings by either the federal government, the state, or the
Town, provided such buildings or structures are judged by the Building Official to be safe and in
the public interest of health, safety and welfare.

Section 102.7 Referenced codes and standards, is amended to read as follows:

The codes and standards referenced in this code shall be the Florida Building Code, the Florida
Fire Prevention Code, the Life Safety Code and any other code or standard contained in Articles
I, ll and IV in Chapter 6 of the Land Development Code. Where there are differences between
provisions of this code, the Florida Building Code and any other code or standard contained in
Articles Ii, Ill and IV in Chapter 6 of the Land Development Code, the Florida Building Code, the
Florida Fire Prevention Code, the Life Safety Code, and any other code or standard contained
in Articles I, Ill, and IV in Chapter 6 of the Land Development Code shall prevail.

Section 103 Department of Property Maintenance Inspection is hereby deleted in its entirety.



(9)
(h)

(i)

@)

(k)

()

(m)

Section 104.4 Right of Entry is hereby deleted in its entirety.
Section 106.3 Prosecution of Violation, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Any person who fails to comply with a notice of violation or order served in accordance with
Section 107 shall be adjudicated in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 162 of the Florida
Statutes or any other method allowed by Florida law, or as provided in the codes and

ordinances of the Town of Fort Myers.

Section 107.2 Form, is hereby amended to read as follows:
The notice prescribed in Section 107.1 shall comply with the requirements of F.S. ch. 162.

Section 107.3 Method of Service, is hereby amended to read as follows:

All notices shall be deemed to have been properly served if the service requirements contained
in F.S. ch. 162 have been met.

Section 107.5 Penalties, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Penalties for noncompliance with orders and notices shall be as set forth in F.S. ch. 162, and
the codes and ordinances of the Town of Fort Myers Beach.

Section 107.6 Transfer of Ownership, is hereby amended to read as follows:

If the owner of property that is subject to an code enforcement proceeding before the special
magistrate, or court transfers ownership of such property between the time the notice of
violation was served and the time of the hearing, such owner shall:

(1) Disclose, in writing, the existence and the nature of the proceeding to the prospective
transferee.

(2) Deliver to the prospective transferee a copy of the pleadings, notices, and other materials
relating to the code enforcement proceeding received by the transferor.

(3) Disclose, in writing, to the prospective transferee that the new owner will be responsible for
compliance with the applicable code and with orders issued in the code enforcement
proceeding.

(4) File a notice with the code official of the transfer of the property, with the identity and
address of the new owner and copies of the disclosures made to the new owner, within 5
days after the date of the transfer.

(6) A failure to make the disclosures described in paragraphs (1), (2), and (3) before the
transfer creates a rebuttable presumption of fraud. If the property is transferred before the
hearing, the proceeding shall not be dismissed, but the new owner shall be provided a
reasonable period of time to correct the violation before the hearing is held.

Section 108.2 Closing of vacant structures, is hereby amended to read as follows:

If the structure is vacant and unfit for human habitation and occupancy, and is not in danger of
structural collapse, the code official is authorized to post a placard of condemnation on the
premises and order the structure closed up so as not to be an attractive nuisance. Upon failure
of the owner to close up the premises within the time specified in the order, the code official
shall cause the premises to be closed and secured through any available public agency or by
contract or arrangement by private persons and the cost thereof shall be charged against the
real estate upon which the structure is located and shall be a lien upon such real estate for said
costs. The lien shall be superior to all other liens and encumbrances, including prior recorded
mortgage or judgments and only inferior to liens for taxes. In the event the owner or person
creating the need for closing or securing the premises fails and refuses to pay or reimburse the
Town for the costs, the Town may foreclose said lien in accordance with the law applicable to



(n)

(0)

(P)

(q)

(r)

(s)

the foreclosure of such liens and the Town shall be entitled to recover its reasonable attorney's
fees and costs incurred in such foreclosure action.

Section 108.7 Record, is hereby amended to read as follows:

The code official shall prepare a report on an unsafe condition. In addition, a written notice of
the unsafe condition shall be recorded in the public records for Lee County. The notice shall
state the occupancy of the structure and the nature of the unsafe condition.

Section 109.5 Costs of emergency repairs, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Costs incurred in the performance of emergency work shall be paid by the Town. All costs
incurred by the Town in the performance of emergency work shall be a lien upon such real
estate for said costs. The lien shall be superior to all other liens and encumbrances, including
prior recorded mortgage or judgments and only inferior to liens for taxes. In the event the owner
or person creating the need for emergency repairs fails and refuses to pay or reimburse the
Town for the costs, the Town may foreclose said lien in accordance with the law applicable to
the foreclosure of such liens and the Town shall be entitied to recover its reasonable attorney's
fees and costs incurred in such foreclosure action.

Section 109.6 Hearing, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Any person ordered to take emergency measures shall comply with such order forthwith. Any
affected person shall thereafter, upon appeal to the Town Council, be afforded a hearing as
described in this code.

Section 110.1 General, is hereby amended to read as follows:

The code official shall order the owner of any premises upon which is located any structure,
which in the code official's judgment after review is so deteriorated or has become so out of
repair as to be dangerous, unsafe, unsanitary or otherwise unfit for human habitation or
occupancy, and such that it is unreasonable to repair the structure, to demolish and remove
such structure; or if such structure is capable of being made safe by repairs, to repair and make
safe and sanitary, or to board up and hold for future repair or to demolish and remove at the
owner's option; or where there has been a cessation of normal construction in accordance with
the Florida Building Code, the code official shall order the owner to demolish and remove such
structure, or board up until future repair. Boarding the building up for future repair shall not
extend beyond one year, unless approved by the Building Official.

Section 110.3 Failure to comply, is hereby amended as follows:

If the owner of a premises fails to comply with a demolition order within the time prescribed, the
Town shall cause the structure to be demolished and removed, either through an available
public agency or by contract or arrangement with private persons, and the cost of such
demolition and removal shall be charged against the real estate upon which the structure is
located and shall be a lien upon such real estate for said costs. In the event the owner or
person creating the need for demolition and removal fails and refuses to pay or reimburse the
Town for the costs, the Town may foreclose said lien in accordance with the law applicable to
the foreclosure of such liens and the Town shall be entitled to recover its reasonable attorney's
fees and costs incurred in such foreclosure action.

Section 111.1 Application for appeal, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Any person directly affected by a decision of the code official or a notice or order issued
pursuant to this code shall have the right to appeal to the Town Council, provided that a written
application for appeal is filed within 20 days after the day the decision, notice or order was
served on the affected person or from the date of posting on the property. An application for
appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted
thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, that the provisions of this code do not fully apply,
or the requirements of this code are adequately satisfied by other means. This section shall not



()
(w)

v)

(w)

(x)

(y)

apply to orders issued by the Town special magistrate in connection with a code enforcement
special magistrate hearing.

Sections 111.2 through Section 111.8 are hereby deleted in their entirety.
Section 112.4 Failure to comply, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be guilty of a code violation and shall be subject to a fine as determined by the
Town special magistrate.

Section 302.3 Sidewalks and driveways, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 302.3. Sidewalks, driveways and rights-of-way. All sidewalks, walkways, stairs,
driveways, parking spaces, and similar areas shall be kept in a proper state of repair, and
maintained free from hazardous conditions. Trees and shrubs shall be maintained to provide for
horizontal clearance of at least three (3) feet from and vertical clearance of at least eight (8) feet
above any sidewalk, bike path, or street right-of-way. Unpaved areas shall be regularly mowed
or otherwise maintained in a neat and attractive condition.

Section 302.4 Weeds, is hereby amended to read as follows:

All premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds or plant growth in
excess of 12 inches. Weeds shall be defined as all grasses, annual plants and vegetation, other
than trees or shrubs, provided, however, this term shall not include cultivated flowers and
gardens and native beach vegetation such as sea oats. Upon failure of the owner or agent
having charge of a property to cut and destroy weeds after service of a notice of violation and
having been given a reasonable time to cut and destroy the weeds, any duly authorized
employee of the Town or contractor hired by the Town shall be authorized to enter upon the
property in violation and cut and destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such
removal shall be paid by the owner or agent responsible for the property. All costs incurred by
the Town to cut and destroy the weeds shall be a lien upon such real estate for said costs. The
lien shall be superior to all other liens and encumbrances, including prior recorded mortgage or
judgments and only inferior to liens for taxes. In the event the owner or agent fails and refuses
to pay or reimburse the Town for its costs, the Town may foreclose said lien in accordance with
the law applicable to the foreclosure of such liens and the Town shall be entitled to recover its
reasonable attorney's fees and costs incurred in such foreclosure action.

Section 302.8 Motor Vehicles, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 302.8 Motor Vehicles and Boats. Except as provided for in other regulations, no
inoperative or unlicensed motor vehicle or boat shall be parked, kept or stored on any premises,
and no vehicle or boat shall at any time be in a state of major disassemble, disrepair, or in the
process of being stripped or dismantled. Painting of vehicles or boats is prohibited unless
conducted inside an approved spray booth.

Exception: A vehicle or boat of any type is permitted to undergo major overhaul, including body
or hull work, provided that such work is performed inside a structure or similarly enclosed area
designed and approved for such purposes.

A new Section 302.10 is hereby added as follows:
Section 302.10 Exterior Storage.
1.  No temporary or permanent storage of materials or equipment is permitted on any vacant

parcel, unless in conjunction with an active building permit or where such storage is
specifically permitted by Chapter 34 of the Land Development Code.



(@)

2. Equipment, materials, and furnishings not designed for use outdoors, such as automotive
parts and tires, building materials, and interior furniture, may not be stored outdoors.

Section 303.2 Enclosures, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Public swimming pools, hot tubs and spas shall include all safety features specified by F.S. §
514.0315, including any subsequent amendments thereto. Residential swimming pools shall be
maintained in compliance with the State Residential Swimming Pool Safety Act, as contained in
F.S. ch. 515.

(aa) A new Section 303.3 is hereby added as follows:

Section 303.3 Disposal of swimming pool water. Prior to disposing of any swimming pool water,
chlorine and bromine levels must be reduced by not adding chlorine or bromine for a least five
(5) days or until levels are below 0.1 mg per liter. One of the following methods of disposal shall
be utilized:

1. Discharge of the water into roadside swales to allow for percolation of the water into the
ground without any runoff to canals, beaches, wetlands, other tidal waters, or onto
adjoining properties. This shall be the preferred method of disposal.

2. Discharge of the water into the sanitary sewer system operated by Lee County Utilities is
also permitted, but is not the preferred method.

Under no circumstances shall any swimming pool water be discharged either directly or
indirectly onto the beach, or into canals, wetlands, or any other tidal waters.

(bb) Section 304.3 Premises Identification, is hereby amended to read as follows:

(cc)

All buildings shall have address numbers that have been assigned by Lee County placed in a
position to be plainly legible and visible by emergency personnel from the street or road fronting
the property. All address numbers shall contrast with their background. Address numbers shall
be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters. Numbers shall be a minimum of 3 inches high. Numbers
on all commercial, institutional, or multifamily buildings that are set back more than 50 feet from
the street shall be at least eight inches high.

Section 304.14 Insect screens, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Every window in a residential structure that is capable of being opened and every door, window,
and other outside opening required for ventilation of habitable rooms, food preparation areas,
food service areas or any areas where products to be included or utilized in food for human
consumption are processed, manufactured, packaged, or stored shall be supplied with
approved tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm), and
every screen door used for insect contro! shall have a self-closing device in good working
condition. Screens shall not, however, be required where other approved means, such as air
curtains or insect repellent fans, are employed.

(dd) A new Section 308.4 is hereby added as follows:

308.4 Additional Regulations for Rubbish and Garbage Containers.

1. Rubbish and Garbage containers shall not be moved to the street more than 24 hours prior
to scheduled curbside collection, nor remain there more than 24 hours after scheduled
collection.

2. Each refuse container that is not movable shall be opaquely screened from view from
streets and adjoining properties and such screening shall be of sufficient height to entirely
screen the container. Screening may be achieved by landscaping, wall, or opaque fencing
provided the wall or fence does not exceed the maximum height permitted for the property.



3. Any rubbish or garbage container not located within a roofed enclosure must have a cover
or lid that renders the interior of the container inaccessible to animals.

(ee) Section 402.2 Common halls and stairways, is hereby amended to read as follows:

()

Every common hall and stairway in residential occupancies, other than in one- and two-family
dwellings, shall be lighted at all times with at least a 60-watt standard incandescent light bulb for
each 200 square feet (19 m 2) of floor area or equivalent illumination, provided that the spacing
between lights shall not be greater than 30 feet (9.144 m). In other than residential occupancies,
means of egress, including exterior means of egress, stairways shall be illuminated at all times
the building space served by the means of egress is occupied with a minimum of 1 footcandle
(11 lux) at floors, landings and treads, provided, however, that during Sea turtle nesting season
(May 1 through October 31), the provisions of Chapter 32, Article V of the Fort Myers Beach
Land Development Code shall supersede the foregoing requirements (correct reference?).

Section 507 Storm Drainage, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Drainage of roofs and paved areas, yards and courts, and other open areas on the premises
shall not be discharged in a manner that creates a public nuisance. Point sources of stormwater
discharge from private property directly onto the beach are prohibited. This prohibition includes
drainage collected from parking lots or other paved surfaces and stormwater from roofs of
buildings.

(9g) A new Section 602.7 is hereby added as follows:

Section 602.7 Screening of Mechanical Equipment. Any new mechanical equipment placed on
a roof shall be screened from view from ground level of adjoining properties and public rights-of-
way. When mechanical equipment is being replaced on a roof of a building that is not
undergoing structural alterations, such equipment shall be screened to the same standard using
non-structural materials such as ornamental latticework.

(hh) Section 701.1 Scope, is hereby amended to read as follows:

The provisions of this chapter shall govern the minimum conditions and standards for fire safety
relating to structures and exterior premises, including fire safety facilities and equipment to be
provided. All references to the "International Fire Code" in this Chapter 7 shall be replaced with
the "Florida Fire Prevention Code."

* %k

Sec. 6-14. - Neighborhood flooding.

(a)

Chapter 10 of this code requires stormwater management systems for new development (see §
10-321). Development that is not subject to those requirements, such as single-family and two-
family dwellings, detached structures, pools, pool decks, additions, pavers, driveways, patios,
etc. on existing lots, can also flood surrounding lots and streets, especially if the lot is raised
higher than adjoining properties or if rainfall is concentrated by gutters and downspouts and
discharged without an opportunity for infiltration. The placement of fill on vacant properties have
the potential to also cause surrounding lots and streets to flood and therefore when no other
development permit is being obtained at the time fill is being brought to the site, a site fill permit
must be obtained. The fill permit application must show how normal rainfall one inch (interior
lot) - 1.6 inch (waterfront lot) will have an opportunity to infiltrate into the ground within the lot.

To minimize neighborhood flooding from normal daily rainfall, no more than 67 percent of the
total lot area within a residential zoning district shall be covered with impervious surfaces. The
plans must indicate the method used to maintain a one-inch (interior lot) or 1.6 inch (waterfront
lot) rainfall on-site when more than 500 square feet of impervious surface is proposed.



(1) Roof areas not served by gutters and downspouts must not drain to impervious surfaces,
and must not drain to pervious surfaces that are sloped in excess of five percent.
Surfaces not meeting these requirements must be designed to detain or deflect rainfall,
for instance through the use of earthen ridges, curbs, or retaining walls that prevent
average rainfall from running onto adjoining lots or streets.

* %%

DIVISION 2. - HOUSING CODE

Sec. 6-31. - Adoption; amendments.

The following chapters and sections of the 1997 Standard Housing Code, as published by the
Southemn Building Code Congress International, Inc., 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama, 35213-
1206, are hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this article, with the exceptions set forth as
follows:

Chapter 1, Administration.

Exception: Section 103.2.2(4) is deleted and replaced with new section 103.2.2(4) as follows:

4. State that, if such repairs, reconstruction, alterations, removal or demolition are not voluntarily
completed within the stated time as set forth in the notice, the housing official shall institute such
legal and/or administrative proceeding as may be appropriate.

Exception: Section 103.4 is deleted and replaced with new section 103.4 as follows:

An officer or employee, or member of any board, charged with the enforcement of this code, in the
discharge of his duties, shall not thereby render himself liable personally, and is hereby relieved from
all personal liability for any damage that may accrue to persons or property as a result of any act
required or permitted in the discharge of his duties.

Exception: Section 103.5 is deleted.
Exception: Section 104 is deleted and replaced with new section 104 as follows:

041 .
The housing official shall make, or cause to be made, inspections to determine the condition of
residential buildings and premises in the interest of safeguarding the health and safety of the
occupants of such buildings and of the general public. For the purpose of making such inspections,
the housing official, or his designee, is hereby authorized to enter, examine, and survey, at all
reasonable times, any residential building or premises. If the owner, agent, tenant or other person in
charge thereof refuses to allow the housing official, or his designee, free access to such building or
premises, the housing official may obtain a duly issued search or administrative warrant, pursuant to
F.S. ch. 933, as from time to time amended, or any other applicable law which may be in effect at the
time such warrant is sought.

Exception: Sections 105, 106, and 107, relating to the housing board of adjustment and appeals, are
deleted. Appeals and variances shall be processed and decided in the same manner as for
variances under ch. 34 of the Land Development Code this-eede. Enforcement of this code shall be
in accordance with ch. 1.

Chapter 2, Definitions.
Exception: Delete the definition of "building" and "housing official" found in section 202 and replace

with a new definition of "building” and "housing official” to be used when construing minimum housing
provisions, as follows:

Building —Any structure built or used for shelter or enclosure of persons which has enclosing walls
sheltering 50 percent or more of its perimeter. The term "building" shall be construed as if followed



by the words "or part thereof' and shall include mobile homes, manufactured homes and all
recreational vehicles which have been established as units for permanent living by the filing of a
declaration of domicile with the clerk of the circuit court on or before October 21, 1985; provided,
however, that the foregoing definition specifically excludes hotels and motels.

Housing official —The officer, or his duly authorized representative charged with the administration
and enforcement of this code, which shall be the town manager or designee.

Chapter 3, Minimum Standards for Basic Equipment and Facilities.

Exception: Delete section 302.2 and replace with new section 302.2 as follows:

All required plumbing fixtures shall be located within the dwelling unit and be accessible to the
occupants of same. The water closet, tub or shower, and lavatory shall be located in a room
affording privacy to the user. Bathrooms shall be accessible from habitable rooms, hallways,
corridors or other protected or enclosed areas.

Exception: The following language shall be added to section 302.5:

This section and its subsections shall only apply if the Standard Building Code (as published by the
Southern Building Code Congress) and any local amendments thereto, required heating facilities at
the time the building was constructed.

Exception: Delete section 302.5.3 and replace with new section 302.5.3 as follows:

Unvented fuel burning heaters shall be prohibited except for gas heaters listed for unvented use
where the total input rating of the unvented heater is less than 30 BTU per hour per cubic foot of
room content and provided that the gas heater is installed pursuant to the Gas Code as adopted
herein at section 6-171. Notwithstanding the above, all unvented fuel-burning heaters shall be
prohibited in bedrooms and sleeping areas.

DIVISION 3. - UNSAFE BUILDING ABATEMENT CODE
Sec. 6-36. - Adoption; amendments.

The following chapters and sections of the 1985 Standard Unsafe Building Abatement Code, as
published by Southern Building Code Congress International, Inc., 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham,
Alabama 35213-1208, are hereby adopted by reference and made part of this article, with the exceptions
set forth as follows:

Chapter |, Administration.

Section 105, relating to the board of adjustment and appeals, is deleted, and replaced by the
procedures set forth for the delegation of authority to Lee County's Construction Board of Adjustment and
Appeals found in division 2 of article Il of this chapter.

Chapter Il, Definitions.

Chapter lll, Inspection and Notice of Noncompliance.
Chapter IV, Appeals.

Chapter V, Rules of Procedure for Hearing Appeals.
Chapter VI, Implementation.

Chapter VI, Recovery of Cost of Repair or Demolition.



Exception: If the building official proceeds to demolish the building or structure as set forth herein,
the town council shall, by proper resolution, assess the entire cost of such demolition and removal against
the real property upon which such cost was incurred, which assessment, when made, shall constitute a
lien upon the property superior to all others except taxes. The lien shall be filed in the public land records
of the county. The resolution of assessment and lien must indicate the nature of the assessment and lien,
the lien amount, and an accurate description of the property affected. The lien becomes effective on the
date of filing such notice of lien and shall bear interest from such date at the rate of ten percent per
annum. If the resulting lien is not satisfied within two years after the date it is filed, then the town may:

(1) File suit to foreclose on the liened property as provided by law in suits to foreclose mortgages;
or

(2) Follow any other lawful process or procedure available for enforcement of the lien in
accordance with any general law of the state relating to the enforcement of municipal liens.

*k ¥k

ARTICLE II. - BUILDING CODES
DIVISION 1. - GENERALLY

Sec. 6-41. - Applicability of article.

This article applies to the incorporated area of the Town of Fort Myers Beach.
Sec. 6-42. - Penalty for violation of article; additional remedies.

Any person, or any agent or representative thereof, who violates any provision of this article shall,
upen-conviction; be subject to the following penalties set forth in the codes and ordinances of the Town of
Fort Myers Beach.: The town council may institute in any court, or before any administrative board of
competent jurisdiction, action to prevent, restrain, correct or abate any violation of this article or of any
order or regulations made in connection with its administration or enforcement, and the court or
administrative board shall adjudge such relief by way of injunction, or any other remedy allowed by law, or
otherwise, to include mandatory injunction as may be proper under all the facts and circumstances of the
case in order to fully effectuate the regulations adopted under this article, or any amendment thereto, and
any orders and rulings made pursuant thereto.

&

Sec. 6-43. - Conflicting provisions.

Whenever the requirements or provisions of this article are in conflict with the requirements or
provisions of any other lawfully adopted ordinance, code or regulation, the provisions providing the
greater degree of life safety will apply. Any conflict between the building code and applicable fire safety
codes will be resolved by agreement between the building official and the fire official in favor of the
requirement of the code which offers the greatest degree of life safety or alternative which would provide
an equivalent degree of life safety and an equivalent method of construction.

Sec. 6-44. - Enforcing officers.



Designated officials such as the building official referenced by the codes adopted in this chapter shall
be appointed by the town manager. The designated officials shall carry out the duties enumerated in
these codes and shall be deemed the responsible officials with respect to enforcement of the provisions
of these codes.

Sec. 6-45. - Permit fees.

The Ttown Ceouncil has the power to determine and set reasonable permlt fees Unless a different
fee schedule is set, permits fees shall be as referenced in

AppendixC{External-Fees-and-Charges-ManuahyTown of Fort Myers Beach Fee Schedule.

Jedede

DIVISION 2. - LEE COUNTY'S BOARDS OF ADJUSTMENT AND APPEALS
Sec. 6-71. - Applicability of division.

This division shall include, but not be limited to, any contractor, owner, agent, manufacturer or
supplier providing construction services or materials regulated by standard codes enforced by the Town
of Fort Myers Beach.

Sec. 6-72. - Intent of division.

The town has adopted various standard codes relating to building, plumbing, mechanical, gas,
electrical, unsafe buildings, housing and fire. This division is intended to be construed in conjunction with
these codes.

Sec. 6-73. - Boards established; jurisdiction.

Lee County has established a construction board of adjustment and appeals known as the Lee
County Board of Adjustment and Appeals
Bevelopment-Gode. The purpose of that board is to hear and deC|de appeals from the decision of the
county's building official and fire official or their designees on any of the various standard codes regulated
and enforced by the county except the plumbing code and mechanical code. Lee County has also
established separate boards of adjustment and appeals to arbitrate matters involving the plumbing code
and mechanical code.

Sec. 6-74. - Delegation of authority to Lee County's Boards of Adjustment and Appeals.

(a) The Town of Fort Myers Beach hereby delegates to each of the three Lee County Boards of
Adjustment and Appeals the authority to make decisions on appeals that may be filed in
accordance with § 6-80 of this division.

(b) The town attorney will provide legal advice to each of the three Lee County Boards of
Adjustment and Appeals when warranted.

kK

Sec. 6-80. - Right of appeal; notice of appeal.

(a)  Whenever the building official or fire official or their designees shall reject or refuse to
approve the mode or manner of construction to be followed or materials to be used, or when
it is claimed that the provisions of a code do not apply, or that an equally good or more
desirable form of construction can be employed in any specific case, or when it is claimed
that the true intent and meaning of a code or any of the regulations thereunder have been
misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the owner of such building or structure, or his duly
authorized agent, may appeal from the decision of the building official or fire official or their
designees to Lee County's appropriate Board of Adjustment and Appeals. Notice of appeal
shall be in writing and filed within 30 days after the decision is rendered by the building official
or fire official or their designees. All requests for appeal shall be on forms provided by the
building official with payment of the appropriate fee.



(b) In the case of a building or structure which in the opinion of the building official is unsafe or
dangerous, the building official may, in his order, limit the time for such appeal to a shorter
period.

Sec. 6-81. - Variations and madifications.

(a) Lee County's Boards of Adjustment and Appeals, pursuant to an appeal from a decision of
the building official or fire official or their designees, may vary the application of a code to any
particular case when, in its opinion and based upon sufficient evidence, the enforcement
thereof would do manifest injustice and would be contrary to the spirit and purpose of a code
or public interest, or when, in its opinion and based upon sufficient evidence to the contrary,
the interpretation of the building official or fire official or their designees should be modified or
reversed.

(b)  Any decision of Lee County Boards of Adjustment and Appeals to vary the application of any
provision of a code or to modify an order of the building official or fire official or their
designees shall specify the variation or modification made, the conditions upon which it is
made, and the reasons therefor.

(c) Variances to the floodplain regulations must meet the additional criteria in article 1V of this
chapter.

Sec. 6-82. - Decisions.

(a) Every decision of Lee County's Boards of Adjustment and Appeals shall be final; subject,
however, to any remedy an aggrieved party might have at law or in equity. Every decision
shall be in writing and shall indicate the vote upon the decision. Every decision of Lee
County's Boards of Adjustment and Appeals shall be signed and attested to by the chairman
of the board.

(b) Lee County's Boards of Adjustment and Appeals shall, in every case, reach a decision
without unreasonable or unnecessary delay.

(c) If a decision of any of Lee County's Boards of Adjustment and Appeals reverses or modifies a
refusal, order or disallowance of the building official or fire official or their designees, or varies
the application of any provision of a code, the appropriate official shall immediately take
action in accordance with such decision.

(d) Any aggrieved person may obtain judicial review of the decision of Lee County's Boards of
Adjustment and Appeals by filing a petition for writ of certiorari in the circuit court. Such
petition must be filed within 30 calendar days after the board of adjustment and appeals'
decision, but not thereafter, pursuant to the Florida Rules of Civil Procedure. The original
petition for writ of certiorari must be filed with the clerk of the circuit court. Copies of the
petition shall be filed with the building official for forwarding to the town attorney.

ks

DIVISION 3. - BUILDING CODE
Sec. 6-111. - Adoption; amendments.

The Florida Building Code is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this article, including
all revisions and amendments approved in accordance with state law, with the exceptions set forth as
follows:

Chapter 1, Administration.

Sections 103.1 through 103.6 relating to powers and duties of the building official are added as
follows:

103.1 General. The building official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce the provisions of this
code and building codes adopted by the state of Florida. The building official has the authority to



render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies and procedures in order to clarify the
application of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies, and procedures must be in compliance
with the intent and purpose of this code, and may not have the effect of waiving requirements
specifically provided for in this code.

103.2 Right of entry.

103.2.1 Whenever necessary to make an inspection to enforce any of the provisions of this
code, or whenever the building official has reasonable cause to believe that there exists in any
building or upon any premises any condition or code violation which makes such building,
structure, premises, electrical, gas, mechanical, or plumbing systems unsafe, dangerous, or
hazardous, the building official may enter such building, structure, or premises at all reasonable
times to inspect the same or to perform any duty imposed upon the building official by this code.
If such building or premises are occupied, he must first present proper credentials and request
entry. If such building, structure, or premises are unoccupied, he must first make a reasonable
effort to lccate the owner or other persons having charge or control of such and request entry. If
entry is refused, the building official has recourse to every remedy provided by law to secure
entry.

103.2.2 When the building official has obtained a proper inspection warrant or other remedy
provided by law to secure entry, no owner or occupant or any other persons having charge,
care, or control of any building, structure, or premises may fail or neglect, after proper request is
made as herein provided, to promptly permit entry therein by the building official for the purpose
of inspection and examination pursuant to this code.

103.3 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the building official, work on any building, structure,
electrical, gas, mechanical, or plumbing system that is being done contrary to the provisions of
this code, or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, must immediately cease. Such notice must be in
writing and posted on the permit board, stating the reasons for the order. Work may only
resume after lifting of the stop work order by the building official.

103.4 Revocation of permits. The building official is authorized to suspend or revoke a permit
issued under the provisions of this code wherever the permit is issued in error or on the basis of
incorrect, inaccurate, or incomplete information, or in violation of any ordinance or regulation or

any provision of this any code of the Town of Fort Myers Beach.

103.4.1 Misrepresentation of application. The building official may revoke a permit or approval
issued under the provisions of this code if there has been any false statement or
misrepresentation as to a material fact in the application or plans on which the permit or
approval was based.

103.4.2 Violation of code provisions. The building official may revoke a permit upon
determination by the building official that the construction, erection, alteration, repair, moving,
demolition, installation, or replacement of the building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical, or
plumbing systems for which the permit was issued is in violation of, or not in conformity with, the
provisions of this code.

103.5 Unsafe buildings or systems. All buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, or
plumbing systems which are unsafe, unsanitary, or do not provide adequate egress, or which
constitute a fire hazard, or are otherwise dangerous to human life, or which in relation to
existing use, constitute a hazard to safety or health, are considered unsafe buildings or service
systems. All such unsafe buildings, structures or service systems are hereby declared illegal
and must be abated by repair and rehabilitation or by demolition in accordance with the
provisions of the Unsafe Building Abatement Code (see article | of this chapter).

103.6 Requirements not covered by code. Any requirements necessary for the strength,
stability, or proper operation of an existing or proposed building, structure, electrical, gas,



mechanical, or plumbing system, or for the public safety, health, and general weilfare, not
specifically covered by this or the other technical codes, will be determined by the building
official.

Section 104.1.4 is amended to read as follows:
104.1.4. Minor repairs.

Ordinary minor repairs, routine maintenance, or incidental work of a nonstructural nature may be
made without a permit, provided that such repair shall not violate any of the provisions of the
technical codes. For purposes of this section, "ordinary minor repairs” include the replacement of
damaged or worn materials by similar new materials and any other repairs defined as such by the
building official. Ordinary minor repairs under this section may not involve the cutting of any
structural beam or supporting member or include any alterations that would increase habitable floor
area, change the use of any portion of the building, remove or change any required means of egress
or exit access, or affect the structural integrity or fire rating of the building.

Section 104.1.6, relating to time limitations, is amended to add the following:

104.1.6.1 A permit issued shall be construed to be a license to proceed with the work but shall not be
construed as authority to violate, cancel, alter or set aside any of the provisions of this code, nor
shall such issuance of a permit prevent the building official from thereafter requiring a correction of
errors in plans or in construction or of violations of this code. Although a permit issued to an owner is
transferable to another owner, actual notice of the transfer of permit shall be given to the building
official prior to the transfer. Building permits shall be issued following the approval of site and
construction plans. Building permits on multifamily projects shall be issued on each individual
building or structure. Multitenant occupancies, including but not limited to shopping malls, may be
permitted on an individual building or structure (shell); however, individual permits shall be used
separately for tenant spaces.

104.1.6.2 The first inspection required by the permit must be successfully completed within a six-
month pericd of issuance or the permit shall be deemed invalid. All subsequent inspections shall be
made within a six-month period of the most recent inspection until completion of work or the permit
shall become invalid. For purposes of this section, the foundation inspection will be considered the
first inspection.

104.1.6.3 The entire foundation must be completed within the first six months from the issuance of
the permit. Partial inspections due to complexity of the foundation may be made with building
inspector's approval, and job site plans shall be initialed by the inspector only on that portion of the
plans that is inspected, and these inspections are for compliance to plans and specifications and are
in no way to be construed as the first inspection. Subsequent inspections may be made until the
entire foundation is completed. At that time, the foundation will be signed off as the first inspection.
One or more extensions of the building permit for good cause may be granted by the building official
on a project for a period not exceeding 90 days each. The request shall be made by written notice to
the building official at least 30 days prior to expiration of the building permit. The building official may
require compliance with any revised building code, mechanical code, plumbing code, electrical code,
gas code, swimming pool code or fire code requirements in effect at the time of granting any
extension to the building permit. Any extension request denied may be appealed to the town council
by the applicant on a form provided by the building official. The council shall grant or deny the
extension upon a finding of good cause or lack thereof. If granted, the extension or extensions shall
not exceed a period of 90 days each.

Section 106.1.4 relating to new or changed land uses is added as follows:

106.1.4 New or changed land use. A certificate of occupancy will only be granted for a new or
changed use of land if that use is allowable under ch. 34 of this code.



107.6.1 Building permits issued on the basis of an affidavit. Pursuant to the requirements of federal
regulation for participation in the National Flood Insurance Program (44 C.F.R. Sections 59 and 60),
the authority granted to the Building Official to issue permits, to rely on inspections, and to accept
plans and construction documents on the basis of affidavits and plans submitted pursuant to Section
105.14 and Section 107.6, shall not extend to the flood load and flood resistance construction
requirements of the Florida Building Code.

117 VARIANCES IN FLOOD HAZARD AREAS

117.1 Flood hazard areas. Pursuant to F.S. § 5§53.73(5), the variance procedures adopted in the
local floodplain management ordinance shall apply to requests submitted to the Building Official for
variances to the provisions of Section 1612.4 of the Florida Building Code, Building or, as applicable,
the provisions of R322 of the Florida Building Code, Residential. This section shall not apply to
Section 3109 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

Florida Building Code, Building, Section 1612.2.

SUBSTANTIAL DAMAGE. Damage of any origin sustained by a building or structure whereby the
cost of restoring the building or structure to its before-damaged condition would equal or exceed 50
percent of the market value of the building or structure before the damage occurred. The term also
includes flood-related damage sustained by a structure on two separate occasions during a 10-year
period for which the costs of repairs at the time of each such flood event, on average, equals or
exceeds 25 percent of the market value of the structure before the damage occurred.

SUBSTANTIAL IMPROVEMENT. Any repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition or improvement
of a building or structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of the
structure before the improvement or repair is started. If the structure has sustained substantial
damage, any repairs are considered substantial improvement regardiess of the actual repair work
performed. The term does not, however, include either:

1. Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, sanitary or safety
code violations identified by the building official and that are the minimum necessary to assure
safe living conditions.

2. Any alteration of a historic structure provided that the alteration will not preclude the structure's
continued designation as a historic structure.

Florida Building Code, Existing Building, Chapter 2.

SUBSTANTIAL IMPROVEMENT. Any repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition or improvement
of a building or structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of the
structure before the improvement or repair is started. If the structure has sustained substantial
damage, any repairs are considered substantial improvement regardless of the actual repair work
performed. The term does not, however, include either:

1. Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, sanitary or safety
code violations identified by the building official and that are the minimum necessary to assure
safe living conditions.

2. Any alteration of a historic structure provided that the alteration will not preclude the structure's
continued designation as a historic structure.

Florida Building Code, Residential, Section R322.

R322.1.11 Enclosed areas below design flood elevation. Enclosed areas, including crawl spaces,
that are below the design flood elevation shall:

1. Be permitted to enclose up to 100 percent of the area below an elevated building and shall not
extend beyond the perimeter of the building.

2. Have the interior portion of any enclosed area:



Partitioned only to separate parking areas from building access or storage areas;

The minimum number of interior doors necessary for access to the stairway or elevator to
the elevated buildings from areas used for parking or storage;

c. Not temperature-controlled.

3. Have access to enclosed areas intended for building access or storage by no more than one
standard 36-inch exterior door, or one windowless 72-inch double exterior door, in any exterior
wall.

&. Have construction documents include an agreement, signed by the owner, acknowledging the
limitations on allowable uses of the enclosed areas and the conditions of the building permit,
using a form provided by the Floodplain Administrator. This agreement shall be recorded in the
official record books in the office of the clerk of the circuit court to provide additional notice of
these limitations to future purchasers.

R322.1.12 Accessory structures. Accessory structures used for parking and storage shall be
permitted below the base flood if designed and constructed in compliance with Section R322 and the
total cost of an accessory structure does not exceed 10% of the market value of the building or
$17,500 per dwelling unit, whichever is greater. The dollar amount specified may be increased each
year beginning in 2014 by the percentage increase of the Consumer Price Index - All Urban
Consumers (CUP-U), All Items, U.S. City Average maintained by the federal Bureau of Labor
Statistics.

Chapter 33, Site Work, Demolition and Construction.

Section 3311.5 is added, to read as follows:
3311.5 Trash containers.

It shall be unlawful to bury construction debris on the construction site or on any other public or
private property not specifically approved for such use. A suitable trash container and adequate
collection service shall be provided for each construction site. For purposes of this requirement, a
suitable container is any structure, device, receptacle, designated location or combination thereof
which holds construction debris on the construction site in a central location long enough for it to be
removed from the site by means of whatever collection service the contractor chooses to use or may
be required to use pursuant to other applicable laws before such debris is: (1) washed or blown off-
site, (2) contaminates subsurface elements, (3) becomes volatile or malodorous, (4) makes an
attractive nuisance, or (5) otherwise becomes a threat to the public health, safety and welfare.

Chapter 34, Existing Buildings.

Section 3401.1, relating to scope, is modified to read as follows:

3401.1 Scope. Provisions of this chapter and of division 4 of this article shall govern the application
of this code to existing buildings. In interpreting this code, the building official may be guided by the
Nationally Applicable Recommended Rehabilitation Provisions, published in 1997 by the U.S.
Department of Housing and Urban Development.

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the High Velocity Hurricane Zone shall
comply with the provisions of sections 3401.5, 3401.8, and 3401.2.2.1.

Section 3401.2.2.1, relating to change of occupancy, is deleted, and replaced with a new section
3401.2.2.1, to read as follows:

3401.2.2.1 If the occupancy classification or any occupancy subclassifications of any existing
building or structure is changed to a more hazardous occupancy, the building, electrical, gas,



mechanical, and plumbing systems shall be made to conform to the intent of the technical codes as
required by the building official.

Section 3401.5, relating to special historic buildings, is deleted, and replaced with a new section
3401.5, to read as follows:

3401.5 Special historic buildings.

3401.5.1 The provisions of the technical codes relating to the construction, alteration, repair,
enlargement, restoration, relocation or moving of buildings or structures shall not be mandatory for
an existing building or structure identified and classified by the federal, state, county, or town
government as a historic structure, or as a contributing structure in a historic district, when such
building or structure is judged by the building official to be safe and in the public interest of health,
safety, and welfare regarding any proposed construction, alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration,
relocation or moving.

3401.5.2 If it is proposed that a historic building that is undergoing repair, renovation, alternation,
reconstruction, or change of occupancy not comply literally with certain technical standards of this
code, the building official may require the building to be investigated and evaluated by a registered
design professional. Such evaluation shall identify each required feature of the building not in
technical compliance and shall demonstrate how the intent of these provisions is to be complied with
in providing an equivalent level of safety.

Sec. 6-112. - Wind-borne debris region and basic wind speed map.

The entire incorporated area of the Town of Fort Myers Beach lies within the wind-borne debris
region and the 438 160 mph basic wind speed zone as established by section 1606.1.6 and figure 1606
of the Florida Building Code.

Sec. 6-113. - Compliance with outdoor lighting standards.

All building permits must comply with the outdoor lighting standards in §§ 34-1831—34-1860 of this
code.

Sec. 6-114. - Compliance with NPDES erosion control standards.

Stormwater runoff from construction sites must be managed in compliance with §§ 10-606—10-607
of this land development code.

*% %k

DIVISION 4. - EXISTING BUILDINGS CODE
Sec. 6-121. - Purpose.

The purpose of this code is to encourage the continued use or reuse of existing buildings. This code
is designed to supplement the other codes adopted in this article. In interpreting this code, the building
official may be guided by the Nationally Applicable Recommended Rehabilitation Provisions, published in
1997 by the U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development.

Sec. 6-122. - Adoption; amendments.

The following chapters and sections of the 1997 Standard Existing Buildings Code, as published by
the Southern Building Code Congress International, Inc., 9060 Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama,
35213-1206, are hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this article, with the exceptions set
forth as follows:

Chapter 1, Administration.



Section 101.7.1, relating to a change of occupancy, is deleted, and replaced with a new section
101.7.1 to read as follows:

If the occupancy classification or any occupancy subclassifications of any existing building is
changed to a more hazardous occupancy, the building shall be made to conform to the intent of the
Florida Building Code for new construction as required by the building official.

Section 105, relating to the board of adjustment and appeals, is deleted, and replaced by the
procedures set forth for the delegation of authority to Lee County's construction board of adjustment and
appeals found in division 2 of this chapter and article.

Chapter 2, Definitions and Abbreviations.
Chapter 3, Historic Structures, is hereby amended to read as follows:

The provisions of this code relating to the construction, alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration,
relocation or moving of buildings or structures shall not be mandatory for an existing building or structure
identified and classified by the federal, state, county, or town government as a historic structure, or as a
contributing structure in a historic district, when such building or structure is judged by the building official
to be safe and in the public interest of health, safety, and welfare regarding any proposed construction,
alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation or moving.

If it is proposed that a historic building that is undergoing repair, renovation, alternation,
reconstruction, or change of occupancy not comply literally with certain technical standards, the building
official may require the building to be investigated and evaluated by a registered design professional.
Such evaluation shall identify each required feature of the building not in technical compliance and shall
demonstrate how the intent of these provisions is to be complied with in providing an equivalent level of
safety.

Chapter 4, Means of Egress.

Chapter 5, Fire Protection.

Chapter 6, Light, Ventilation and Sanitation.
Chapter 7, Building Services.

Chapter 8, Maintenance.

Appendix A, Rehabilitation Guidelines.

dederk

DIVISION 5. - CONTRACTOR LICENSING
Sec. 6-231. - Contractor licenses required.

Lee County authorizes the issuance of contractor licenses, as authorized by F.S. ch. 489 and Lee
County Ordinance No. 86-20, granting the privilege of engaging in the contracting business within the
jurisdiction of Lee County. The Town of Fort Myers Beach desires to restrict those engaging in the
contracting business to those holding the same categories of licensure as required by Lee County:

(1) State-certified contractors holding an active state certificate of competency;

(2) State-registered contractors holding an active state registration and Lee County certificate of
competency. A Lee County certificate of competency alone is not sufficient if state statute
requires that the contractor also hold a state certificate or registration;

(3) Locally licensed contractors holding an active Lee County certificate of competency; or



(4) Restricted specialty contractors holding an active Lee County restricted certificate of
competency.

Sec. 6-232. - Contractors required to be state-certified.

In accordance with F.S. ch. 489, the—following—types—of contractors must hold a valid state
certification in order to contract in the Town of Fort Myers Beach:

Sec. 6-233. - Contractor categories licensed by Lee County.

& The Town of Fort Myers Beach accepts Lee County certificates of competency in the following
specialty categories:

(41) Aluminum (without concrete) contractor;

(82) Aluminum (nonstructural) contractor;

6)—Asphal ; l . tractor:

(8 3) Cabinet and millwork contractor;

(94) Carpentry contractor;

(48 5) Concrete coatings contractor;

(#46) Concrete forming and placing contractor;

(427) Concrete placing and finishing (flatwork) contractor;
13y —Court-{outdoor)-contractor;

(44 8) Demolition contractor;



(46)—DBrywall-contractor;

(4#£9) Excavation contractor;

(48 10) Fence erection contractor;
(48 11) Finish carpentry contractor,
(28 12) Garage door contractor;
(2+13) Glass and glazing contractor;

(26 15) Insulation (all types) contractor;
(26 16) Irrigation sprinkler contractor;
27 . itioning:
(28 17) Journeyman electrician;

(36 18) Journeyman plumber;

(31} Maroiti : :
32)—Marine-contractor;

(33 19) Masonry contractor;

(34) Master electrical contractor;

(38 20) Painting contractor;

(36 21) Paver block contractor;

(8% 22) Paving contractor;

(38)Pile drivi l :

(3923) Plastering/stucco contractor,

(4324) Sign contractor - limited;
(4425) Sign contractor - restricted,;

(4#26) Tile and marble contractor.




Sec. 6-234. - Delegation of authority to the Lee County Construction Licensing Board.

(a) The Town of Fort Myers Beach hereby delegates to Lee County and the Lee County
Construction Licensing Board the authority to make decisions regarding:

(1) The categories of certificates of competency that Lee County may require or issue;



(b)

(c)

Sec. 6-235.
(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(2) The requirements for obtaining and retaining Lee County certificates of competency;
(3) The issuance, revocation, and cancellation of Lee County certificates of competency;

(4) Disciplinary actions concerning activities within the town by holders of a Lee County
certificate of competency or by state-certified or registered contractors; and

(5) Any other matter within the authority of the Lee County Construction Licensing Board.

The policies, procedures and safeguards applicable to the Lee County Construction
Licensing Board according to Lee County Ordinance No. 96-20, are hereby adopted by the
Town of Fort Myers Beach for all actions of the board regarding violations alleged to have
occurred within the town.

The town attorney will provide legal advice to the Lee County Construction Licensing Board
when warranted.

- Owner-builder exemption.

Owners of property may act as their own contractor and provide direct on-site supervision
themselves of all work not performed by licensed contractors when building or improving:

(1) One-family or two-family residences on the owner's property for the occupancy or use of
the owners and not offered for sale or lease; and

(2) Commercial buildings on the owner's property at a cost not to exceed $25,000.00 for the
occupancy or use of the owners and not offered for sale or lease.

If, within one year of completion, an owner-builder sells, leases, or offers for sale or lease any
building constructed or improved under an owner-builder exemption, the town can presume
the construction or improvement was undertaken for the purposes of sale or lease.

This section does not exempt any person the owner-builder employs, or has a contract with,
to act in the capacity of a contractor. The owner cannot delegate the owner's responsibility to
directly supervise all work to any other person unless that person is duly licensed in
accordance with this erdinance code and the work performed is within the scope of that
contractor's license.

To qualify for exemption under this section, an owner cannot be a corporation. partnership or
trust and must personally appear and sign the building permit application. The owner must
also execute a disclosure statement prepared by the building official acknowledging
compliance with all applicable regulations.

Sec. 6-236. - Other exemptions.

The licensing provisions of this article do not apply to:

(1)

Any employee of a duly licensed contractor who is acting within the scope of the employer's
license or with the employer's knowledge and permission. However, if the employer is not
licensed to perform the type of services the employee is contracting to perform, then the
employee is not exempt if the employee:

a. Holds himself or his employer out to be licensed or qualified by a licensee to perform
services outside the scope of the employer’'s license;

b. Leads the consumer to believe that the employee has an ownership or management
interest in the company; or

c. Performs any of the acts which constitute contracting for services outside the scope of
the employer's license.

The intent of this subsection is to place equal responsibility on the unlicensed business and
its employees for the protection of the consumers in contracting transactions.



(2)  An authorized employee of the United States, the state, the county, the town, or any political
subdivision of the state, if the employee does not hold himself out for hire or otherwise
engage in contracting except in accordance with his employment.

3) Contractors and employees working on bridges, roads, streets, highways, or railroads,
including services incidental thereto, that are under the responsible charge of a professional
engineer, duly licensed general contractor, the county, or the state.

(4) A registered professional engineer or architect acting within the scope of his practice or any
person exempted by the law regulating engineers and architects, including a person doing
design work as specified in F.S. § 481.229(1)(b). However, an engineer or architect cannot
act as a contractor unless properly licensed in accordance with this article.

(5) An architect or landscape architect licensed under F.S. ch. 481 or a professional engineer
licensed under F.S. ch. 471 who offers or renders design-build services. However, a state-
certified general contractor must perform the construction services under the design-build
contract.

Division 2 — Accessory Uses, Buildings, and Structures

Sec. 34-1180. — Garages

(a) Garage Door sizes shall be limited to one or two-car doors.

(b) No more than three consecutive stalls (three singles or one single and one double) shall be
grouped together. Additional doors require a minimum 8 feet wide architectural element,

feature, or access, to break up the facade between door groupings.

Secs. 34-11801—34-1200. - Reserved.



e m——-
3DVLI0D DESE ON|

'S3ULHVd MOT38 3H1 01 ATINSNTINT C3L4ILN3D
‘S3LLEVA MOT3E 3HL 0L ATAAISNTIXG Q311430

B69¥C 14 ‘NIGINNG “INN3AY DHIFTI0BH LI0Z = NOLYDOT E .
WOD WOATAUAS - VOINOLE MARS/ dLLI O AONLIKONY RMR/ /AL ONI "MON LI MONA *E Ga%ii%‘io ONY Q3INMO
B69¥C 14 "NIGINNG “1ZCF "ITIUIS NIV LB¥L  ONNIVA

c0e8-¢l
zigs o1 muny wnoneary | SAHAYNS HTHVAYOAAV

\202-£0~10 3iva
[Ty Ve
610Z-52-91 auva

LLVAH TUH WOIOVEEOAIANNSY QMO 14 OF =1 WX
)
ar 0 ]

9cgy ssquiny saddo B sokaring
AT AAARLE (I 40 4LV

JSUVNOS GNY YIS QISSORRT AISIvE ¥ B0 WIS ONY JENIVADS JiNOBIDIT
VIUNIUOY NY IDOHIM QrivA 10N 51 ONY NOUI3eG AR 4IGND
AJANNS T ONSN JIWE0D ONY INM] S ASANNS SR IV ASUN3D ABFIH |

ONNOA SHIXEYA ANSNS 01 NOUYISH M SINGAGAOSGN TI0SA ONMONS ASAENS 1TWNG-5¥ NY SI1 A0S SHL ISWEBUO T VIS SSTWI)

83T eI A Tl s MY L M A W YR R IOPEY ALTUR I TSR s 0 s B Tiss ) sl oy
g 1 "t AT Do 4 1A (4] TING B0 e T Bach) AN DT
Nt NIVACA L1 ON) DML A4 D ¥ QW i ket ath 4 NI
A MOT 0T Tl T MO 4T T B o) /3 3 ST o1 Y08 TV 3 TR VO (3) e

1
H
3
H
H
:
5
!
;
i
:
|
:
;
i
§
:
i
:
i
i

LIS S SO deva S¥ QL30T NI LON JAYN
SIRUN 40 SMOLYOMD) CEDUIIN QN SONTHND = Al Gint 410 80 MO SINVISA) T sy 1 voucoa SIONVISE Waiets Jav SIONLE A = S04 NS5
38 USIA NOUYASON SHG TS0 51 SIV M CUOO3 MO JS0KI AW APUQ TRO2Y JO AV O S1A0% $0 SINGAISY] JO MOUFIO1 4 SLYIS U0 NLVUISMNADY FOR0 U

CUON SSTHN (OANSSY B0 SNEYIA 1V1d ONSN) 3NN A/H 51 SINGYIE 0 SEVE

=] =B00 =l sz (9)

TR L
HIN0D JFT A0 SOMOORS WS I X0 K1 TING 7 K000 LY N QRROII
ORI 1V D OI DNONIODN MOSHORTS JAViOVES Y 00W Wi i01

4314 001 HINOS I 0 L3NS L TR ISYI DU ONY §1 101 S0 1124 OF S5 U

YOl NS 2 0
SRy X B 0 YI Tvd ¥ ORI N CIOITS OB (¥
O SO NOSRORS MYAOVE ¥ 00N Wi 107 40 1324 Of HUEN P

IFSTE YOO SOV SaBA 1804 "N TONIICD OOVE-EECE
WO I ITT

TV U HOWIE SUB 404 SO SISO ONYS Uivel
TTET

B9 0PN 06T MOUFATT] “TIVLIOD B L) 40 MO IISHI M
O TR O P HION ¥ ONTOS SAYRRONE O ISYS JY MSONS SMOURATI] TION




